AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 936

To provide for drought preparedness measures in the State of New Mexico,

and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

AvgusT 4, 2015

Mr. Upann (for himself and Mr. HEINRICH) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Energy and Nat-
ural Resources

A BILL

To provide for drought preparedness measures in the State

N O e AW

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

1
2
3
4.
5
6

of New Mexico, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the

“New Mexico Drought Preparedness Act of 20157,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents of

this Act is as follows:

. Short title; table of contents.

. Definitions.

. Water acquisition program.

Water conservation.

. Middle Rio Grande peak flow restoration.
. National Academy of Sciences study.



O o0 39 N L B WL

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

See
See
See

SE

*S 1936 IS

. 7. Emergency funding.
. 8. Secure Water Act reauthorization.

. 9. Reclamation States Emergency Drought Relief Act reauthorization.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

10. Rio Grande Pueblo irrigation infrastructure reauthorization.
11. Regional conservation partnership program.

12. Conservation reserve program.

13. Effect on State law.

C. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act:

of—

(1) BASIN.—The term ‘“Basin” means ecach

A) the Upper Rio Grande Basin;
B) the Middle Rio Grande Basin;
() the Lower Rio Grande Basin;

D) the Lower Pecos River Basin;

e

) the Canadian River Basin;
S

(

(

(

(

(E) the Gila River Basin;
(

(G) the

(

H) the San Juan River Basin.

(2) DisTrICT.—The term ‘“‘District” means the

Middle Rio Grande Conservancy District.

(3) PUEBLO.—The term ‘“Pueblo” means each

of the following pueblos in the State:

A) Cochiti.
B) Santo Domingo.
() San Felipe.

(

(

(

(D) Santa Ana.
(E) Sandia.

(

F) Isleta.

an Francisco River Basin; and



O o0 N N Bk W -

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

3

(4) SECRETARIES.—The term ‘‘Secretaries”
means—

(A) the Administrator of the Environ-
mental Protection Agency;

(B) the Secretary of Commerce; and

(C) the Secretary of the Interior.

(5) SECRETARY.—The term “‘Secretary” means
the Secretary of the Interior.

(6) STATE.—The term ‘“State’” means the State
of New Mexico.

SEC. 3. WATER ACQUISITION PROGRAM.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, acting through the
Commissioner of Reclamation, shall carry out in the Ba-
sins a water acquisition program in coordination with the
other appropriate Federal agencies, State agencies, and
non-Federal stakeholders, under which the Secretary
shall—

(1) make acquisitions of water in the Basins by
lease or purchase of water rights or contractual enti-
tlements from willing lessors or sellers, consistent
with section 8 of the Act of June 17, 1902 (43
U.S.C. 383), and applicable State law relating to the
acquisition and administration of water rights; and

(2) take any other actions, consistent with sec-

tion 8 of the Act of June 17, 1902 (43 U.S.C. 383),

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e
[ B N U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O TR NO S e

4

and applicable State law, that the Secretary deter-
mines would achieve the purposes of the water ac-

quisition program described in subsection (b).

(b) PurPOSES.—The purposes of the water acquisi-
tion program are—

(1) to enhance stream flow to benefit fish and
wildlife (including endangered species), water qual-
ity, and river ecosystem restoration in the Basins;
and

(2) to enhance stewardship and conservation of
working land, water, and watersheds in the Basins,
consistent with the purpose described in paragraph
(1).

(¢) COORDINATION.—To assist in developing and ad-
ministering the program, the Secretary may provide funds
to a federally established nonprofit entity with particular
expertise in western water transactions.

(d) DistrICT PROJECTS.—Subject to State law, the
Secretary may develop programs to provide—

(1) cost-share assistance to the District or agri-
cultural producers and irrigators in the District for
making irrigation system improvements and increase
system efficiency;

(2) incentives to the District for the establish-

ment of a water leasing program from willing lessors

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0 N RN = O

24
25

5

for agricultural producers and irrigators in the Dis-
trict to temporarily lease pre-1907 water rights (in-
stead of permanent severance from irrigable lands)
for the purpose of providing benefits to species listed
under the Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16
U.S.C. 1531 et seq.) and other river ecosystem bene-
fits; and

(3) cost-share assistance to the District to im-
plement infrastructure or operational changes that
will allow for effective management of a leasing pro-
oram, while maintaining adequate water deliveries to
other agricultural producers and irrigators.

There is

(e) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

authorized to be appropriated to the Secretary to carry
out this section $30,000,000.

SEC. 4. WATER CONSERVATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in cooperation

with the District and in consultation with the Pueblos,
may provide funding and technical assistance for the in-
stallation of metering and measurement devices and the
construction of check structures on irrigation diversions,

canals, laterals, ditches, and drains—

(1) to ensure the conservation and efficient use

of water within the District by

(A) reducing actual consumptive use; or

*S 1936 IS



6

1 (B) not increasing the use of water; and
2 (2) to improve the measurement and allocation
3 of water acquired through the water acquisition pro-
4 oram established under section 3.
5 (b) RIO GRANDE, SAN ACACIA AND ISLETA
6 REACHES.—
7 (1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall provide
8 for development of a comprehensive plan for the San
9 Acacia and Isleta reaches to plan, design, construct
10 and prioritize projects that balance river mainte-
11 nance, water availability, use, and delivery, and eco-
12 system benefits, including—
13 (A) planning, permitting, and construction
14 of a pumping station at Bosque del Apache Na-
15 tional Wildlife Refuge for the purpose of more
16 efficiently using water to provide—
17 (1) a stable supply for the Refuge; and
18 (i1) an efficient and reliable supply of
19 water to the Rio Grande for the benefit of
20 the endangered silvery minnow and South-
21 western willow flycatcher;
22 (B) planning, permitting, and construction
23 of a river channel realignment project near the
24 Rio Grande mile-83 for the purpose addressing

*S 1936 IS



7

| river channel aggradation while maintaining
2 floodplain connectivity;
3 (C) planning, permitting, and construction
4 of a controlled outlet for the low flow convey-
5 ance channel to the Rio Grande between Fort
6 Craig, New Mexico, and Rio Grande mile-60 for
7 the purpose of water use and delivery, enhance-
8 ment and development of habitat areas, and
9 possible creation of a single-channel river eco-
10 system; and
11 (D) development of a Liower Reach Plan—
12 (1) to identify additional projects and
13 maintenance activities with water use and
14 delivery and ecosystem benefits; and
15 (i1) to prioritize implementation of all
16 projects and activities.
17 (2) PUBLIC PARTICIPATION.—In carrying out
18 this subsection, the Secretary shall provide a process
19 for public participation and comment during plan
20 development and alternative analysis.
21 (¢) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There is

22 authorized to be appropriated to the Secretary to carry

23 out this section $18,000,000.

*S 1936 IS



8
SEC. 5. MIDDLE RIO GRANDE PEAK FLOW RESTORATION.

[E—

(a) TEMPORARY DEVIATION.—During the 5-year pe-
riod beginning on the date of enactment of this Act, the
Secretary of the Army shall continue the temporary devi-
ation in the operation of Cochiti Lake and Jemez Canyon
Dam, that was initiated in 2009 and terminated in 2013,
to continue to evaluate the benefits of the deviation while

a permanent reauthorization of the reservoirs is pursued.

O o0 9 N W B~ W

(b) FEASIBILITY STUDY AND REPORT.—Not later

[S—
)

than 1 year after the date of enactment of this Act, the

[E—
[E—

Secretary of the Army and the Secretary shall—

[a—
(\9]

(1) conduct a feasibility study to address

[S—
(V)

Jochiti Dam operation limitations on the timing,

[E—
A

magnitude, and duration of flows that support feder-

[a—
W

ally listed species in the Middle Rio Grande, con-

[S—
@)}

sistent with subsection (c¢); and

[E—
3

(2) submit to Congress a feasibility report on

[a—
o0

the reauthorization of the purposes of Cochiti Dam.

19 (¢) GoALS.—The deviation described in subsection

20 (a) shall provide for the detention and release of native
21 Rio Grande water and San Juan-Chama Project water

22 with the goals of—

23 (1) restoring natural river processes to the Rio
24 srande, including a Spring peak flow to the Rio
25 Grande;

*S 1936 IS



9

| (2) increasing the spawning and recruitment of
2 endangered Rio Grande silvery minnows;

3 (3) creating overbanking flows that are nec-
4 essary—

5 (A) to maintain a healthy bosque; and

6 (B) to support habitat for the South-
7 western willow flycatcher and other wildlife;

8 (4) maintaining channel capacity; and

9 (5) increasing water operational flexibility and
10 efficiencies in meeting irrigation and municipal and
11 industrial purposes, if the increased water oper-
12 ational flexibility and efficiencies enhance the goals
13 described in paragraphs (1) and (4).
14 (d) MONITORING.—The Secretary of the Army, in co-

15 operation with the Secretary and other Federal and non-

16 Federal stakeholders shall—

17 (1) monitor the environmental effects, benefits,
18 and results of the deviation mandated under this
19 section; and

20 (2) compile any data necessary to evaluate the
21 need for further amendment to the authorizations
22 and water control manuals for Cochiti Lake or
23 Jemez Canyon Dam.

24 (e) CONSULTATION REQUIRED.—Before imple-

25 menting the proposed deviation under this section, as re-

*S 1936 IS



10

quired by the applicable water control manuals, the Sec-
retary of the Army shall first obtain approval from—
(1) Pueblo de Cochiti regarding the effect of
the deviation on the easement of Pueblo de Cochiti;
(2) Pueblo of Santa Ana; and

(3) the Rio Grande Compact Commission.

(f) REPORTS.—The Secretary of the Army shall pre-
pare and submit to Congress—

(1) for each year in which the deviations are
being carried out under this section, annual reports
that describe the data compiled under subsection
(d)(2); and

(2) at the end of the period described in sub-
section (a), a final, cumulative report that summa-
rizes the data obtained during that period.

() AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There is

authorized to be appropriated to the Secretary of the
Army $3,000,000 to carry out this section.
SEC. 6. NATIONAL ACADEMY OF SCIENCES STUDY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 60 days after the
date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary of the Army
and the Secretary shall enter into an arrangement with
the National Academy of Sciences to carry out a study
on water and reservoir management and operation issues

along the Rio Grande (including the Heron, El Vado,

*S 1936 IS



11
I Abiquiu, Cochiti, Jemez Canyon, Elephant Butte, and

2 Caballo Dams and Reservoirs), which shall include—

3 (1) an evaluation of existing Rio Grande res-
4 ervoir authorizations and legal requirements;

5 (2) a summary of—

6 (A) the physical-hydrologic understanding
7 of existing Rio Grande reservoir operations; and
8 (B) any potential constraints on the Rio
9 Grande reservoir in light of climate change pro-
10 jections;

11 (3) an identification of opportunities to opti-
12 mize water storage and management to benefit the
13 Rio Grande ecosystem, irrigators and municipal
14 users, and to promote water conservation through
15 reauthorization of, reoperation of, regulation of, or
16 physical improvements to the reservoirs;

17 (4) an evaluation of the physical-hydrologic fea-
18 sibility of the identified future reservoir management
19 scenarios;

20 (5) an identification of water use, supply, and
21 accounting impacts to other stakeholders in the
22 State and on the Rio Grande Compact water deliv-
23 eries;

24 (6) consideration of operations such as—

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

12

(A) the storage of supplemental water ac-
quired by and under the control of the Bureau
of Reclamation;

(B) the carryover storage of San Juan-
Chama Project contract water and Pueblo Prior
and Paramount operation water;

(C) changes in timing of water released to
offset municipal pumping;

(D) changes in the timing of storage and
release of floodwaters;

(E) the reduction of evaporative losses
from reservoirs;

(F) conservation of water resulting from
irrigation operation changes by non-Indian and
Pueblo irrigators;

(G) the mmpacts of deliveries of New Mex-
ico Rio Grande Compact water;

(H) the impacts of management and oper-
ations on recreation and hydropower;

(I) the impacts of management and oper-
ations on the Rio Grande ecosystem and the
habitats that support species listed under the
Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C.

1531 et seq.); and

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

13

(JJ) any other factors the Academy deter-
mines to be necessary for purposes of fully eval-
uating opportunities to achieve greater water
conservation, drought resiliency, and ecological
health; and
(7) recommendations for future management

scenarios and measures that Congress should take,
consistent with section 8 of the Act of June 17,
1902 (43 U.S.C. 383), the Rio Grande Compact,
and applicable State law pertaining to the acquisi-
tion and administration of water rights, to assist the
agencies in establishing more flexible operating pro-
cedures to improve the performance of reservoir op-
erations in accommodating multiple purposes.

(b) CosPONSORS.—The Secretary of the Army and

the Secretary may solicit cosponsors for the study under
subsection (a), as appropriate, including State or private
organizations.

(¢) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY OF STUDY.—On the date
on which the National Academy of Sciences completes the
study under this section, the National Academy of
Sciences shall make available to the public the results of
the study.

(d) REPORT.—Not later than 2 years after the date

of enactment of this Act, the National Academy of

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO I S e

14

Sciences shall submit to the Secretary of the Army and
the Secretary a report that contains a summary of the

results of the study conducted under this section.

(e) DUE DEFERENCE.—The Secretary of the Army

and the Secretary shall provide for due deference to the
study and report prepared under this section in water
management activities undertaken by the Secretary of the
Army and the Secretary in the Rio Grande.

SEC. 7. EMERGENCY FUNDING.

(a) FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Financial assistance may be
made available under the Reclamation States Emer-
cgency Drought Relief Act of 1991 (43 U.S.C. 2201
et seq.), title XII of the Food Security Act of 1985
(16 U.S.C. 3801 et seq.), and any other applicable
Federal law (including regulations), to be divided
among each applicable program at the discretion of
the Secretaries for eligible water projects to assist
the State and other Western States address drought-
related impacts to water supplies or any other imme-
diate water-related crisis or conflict.

(2) ADDITIONAL AVAILABILITY.—Financial as-
sistance may be made available under this section to
organizations and entities, including tribal govern-

ments, that are engaged in collaborative processes to

*S 1936 IS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

[\© TN O T N T NG R NS R NS R e T e e T e T e T W =
L R W NN = DO VO XN N R WD~ O

15
restore the environment or are part of a basin-wide
solution for restoration.

(b) TYPES OF ASSISTANCE.—Assistance under sub-

section (a) shall include a range of projects, including—

(1) the installation of pumps, temporary bar-
riers, or operable gates for water diversion and fish
protection;

(2) the installation of drought-relief eround-
water wells for Indian tribes and in wildlife refuges
and other areas;

(3) the acquisition or assistance in the acquisi-
tion of water from willing sellers to enhance stream
flow for the benefit of fish and wildlife (including en-
dangered species), water quality, river ecosystem res-
toration, and other beneficial purposes, to be carried
out in accordance with the water acquisition pro-
oram established under section 3;

(4) agricultural and urban conservation and ef-
ficiency projects providing multiple water supply
benefits;

(5) exchanges with any water district willing to
provide water to meet the emergency water needs of
other water districts in return for the delivery of
equivalent quantities of water later that year or in

future years;

*S 1936 IS



S O 0 N N B W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A W NN = O 0O 0NN N N PR WND

16

(6) maintenance of cover crops to prevent pub-
lic health impacts from severe dust storms;

(7) emergency pumping projects for ecritical
health and safety purposes;

(8) activities to reduce water demand consistent
with a comprehensive program for environmental
restoration and settlement of water rights claims;

(9) the use of new or innovative on-farm water
conservation technologies or methods that may—

(A) assist in sustaining permanent crops in
areas with severe water shortages; and

(B) make water available for other bene-
ficial uses;

(10) activities that protect, restore, or enhance
fish and wildlife habitat or otherwise improve envi-
ronmental conditions, including water quantity or
quality concerns and improved fish passage;

(11) activities reducing or preventing ground-
water depletion or promoting groundwater recharge;

(12) technical assistance to improve existing ir-
rigation practices to provide water supply benefits;

(13) the vestigation of, and pilot projects for,
brackish water development and acquifer storage and

recovery,

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

I S T
B~ W NN = O

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

17

(14) the lining of irrigation ditches and canals
to reduce water loss and improve efficiency;

(15) assistance to municipal water management
entities for water supply planning in preparation for
and in response to dry, critically dry, and below nor-
mal water years, including—

(A) hydrological forecasting;

(B) identification of alternative water sup-
ply sources; and

(C) ouidance on potential water transfer
partners; and

(16) any other assistance the Secretary deter-
mines to be necessary to increase available water
supplies, maintain the health of river ecosystems, or
mitigate drought impacts.

SEC. 8. SECURE WATER ACT REAUTHORIZATION.
Section 9504 of the Omnibus Public Lland Manage-
ment Act of 2009 (42 U.S.C. 10364) is amended—

(1) 1 subsection (a)—

(A) in paragraph (1)(H)—

(1) in clause (1), by striking “or’” after
the semicolon at the end;

(i1) in clause (i1), by striking the pe-

)

riod at the end and inserting ““; or’’; and

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

18

(111) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(i11) to plan for or address the im-
pacts of drought.”; and
(B) in paragraph (3)(E), by adding at the

end the following:

“(v)  AUTHORITY  OF  COMMIS-
SIONER.—The Commissioner of Reclama-
tion may, at the discretion of the Commis-
sioner—

“(I) waive any cost-share require-
ments to address emergency drought
situations;

“(IT) prioritize projects based on

the ability of the projects
“(aa) to expeditiously yield
multiple water supply benefits
during periods of drought; or
“(bb) to prevent any other
immediate water-related crisis or
conflict; and
“(ITI) give priority to projects
demonstrating innovative conservation
tools or methods that balance

instream and out-of-stream water sup-

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG N N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

19
ply needs, including water conserva-
tion and water marketing.”’; and

(2) n subsection (e), by  striking
“$200,000,000” and inserting “$300,000,000”.

SEC. 9. RECLAMATION STATES EMERGENCY DROUGHT RE-
LIEF ACT REAUTHORIZATION.

Section 301 of the Reclamation States Emergency
Drought Relief Act of 1991 (43 U.S.C. 2241) is amend-
ed—

(1) by striking “$90,000,000” and inserting
“$190,000,000”; and

(2) by striking “2012” and inserting “2018”.

SEC. 10. RIO GRANDE PUEBLO IRRIGATION INFRASTRUC-
TURE REAUTHORIZATION.

Section 9106 of the Omnibus Public Lland Manage-
ment Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1304)
is amended—

(1) in subsection (¢)(4), by striking “2 years
after the date of enactment of this Act” and insert-
ing “December 31, 2016”’; and

(2) in subsection (2)(2)—

(A) by striking “$6,000,000” and inserting

“$12,000,000”; and

(B) by striking “2010 through 2019”7 and

inserting “2015 through 2024,

*S 1936 IS



20
1 SEC. 11. REGIONAL CONSERVATION PARTNERSHIP PRO-

GRAM.
The Secretary of Agriculture may allocate financial

assistance made available under subtitle I of title XII of

2

3

4

5 the Food Security Act of 1985 (16 U.S.C. 3871 et seq.)
6 to establish special conservation initiatives at the local,
7 State, or regional level to assist producers in implementing
8 eligible activities on agricultural land in the western States
9

for the purposes of—

10 (1) mitigating the effects of drought on agricul-
11 tural production and the environment;

12 (2) improving water quality and quantity, in-
13 cluding reducing groundwater depletion;

14 (3) restoring, enhancing, and preserving fish
15 and wildlife habitat; and

16 (4) promoting innovative and collaborative con-
17 servation tools and approaches.

18 SEC. 12. CONSERVATION RESERVE PROGRAM.

19 (a) CONSERVATION PRIORITY AREAS.—Section

20 1231(f) of the Food Security Act of 1985 (16 U.S.C.
21 3831(f)) 1s amended—

22 (1) in paragraph (2), by striking “or” and all
23 that follows through the period at the end and in-
24 serting ““, water quantity, or habitat impacts related

25 to agricultural production activities.”’;

*S 1936 IS



O o0 N N Bk W

[\ 2 \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0N N R WD = O

21

(2) in paragraph (3), by striking “or” and all
that follows through the period at the end and in-
serting “‘, water quantity, or habitat impacts related
to agricultural production activities.”; and

(3) in paragraph (4), by striking “water quality
and habitat benefits” and inserting “water quality,
water quantity, and habitat benefits”.

(b) SPECIAL CONSERVATION RESERVE ENHANCE-
MENT PROGRAM.—Section 1234(2)(2)(B) of the Food Se-
curity Act of 1985 (16 U.S.C. 3834(2)(2)(B)) is amended
by inserting ‘, including improving water conservation and
drought mitigation’ before the period at the end.

SEC. 13. EFFECT ON STATE LAW.

(a) IN GENERAL.—An action taken by any of the
Secretaries or other entity under this Act or an amend-
ment made by this Act shall comply with applicable State
laws in effect on the date of enactment of this Act, includ-
ing a law described in subsection (b).

(b) STATE LAW.—Nothing in this Act or an amend-
ment made by this Act affects, is intended to affect, or
interferes with a law of the State relating to the control,
appropriation, use, or distribution of water, or any vested

right acquired under the law.

O

*S 1936 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-08-13T21:55:27-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




