AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1131H CONGRESS
nRE HL R, 3470

To provide for the transfer of naval vessels to certain foreign countries,
and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

NOVEMBER 13, 2013
Mr. ROYCE (for himself and Mr. ENGEL) introduced the following bill; which
was referred to the Committee on Foreign Affairs

A BILL

To provide for the transfer of naval vessels to certain foreign

countries, and for other purposes.
1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE AND TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the

ments Act of 20137,

The table of contents for

2

3

4

5 “Naval Vessel Transfer and Arms Export Control Amend-
6

7 (b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.

8

this Act 1s as follows:
Sec. 1. Short title and table of contents.

TITLE I-—TRANSFER OF NAVAL VESSELS TO CERTAIN FOREIGN
RECIPIENTS



S O 0 N9 N B WD -

e e S S T = T S S
~N O kA WD =

See.

See.
See.
See.
See.
See.

See.

See.

101.

2

Transfer of naval vessels to certain foreign recipients.

TITLE II—ARMS EXPORT CONTROL ACT AMENDMENTS

201.
202.
203.

207.

Inerease in congressional notification thresholds.

Licensing of certain commerce-controlled items.

Amendments relating to removal of items from the United States Mu-
nitions List.

4. Amendment to definition of “security assistance” under the Foreign

Assistance Act of 1961.

5. Amendments to definitions of “‘defense article’” and ‘“defense service”

under the Arms Export Control Act.

6. Revision of statutory references to former NATO support organiza-

tions and related NATO agreements.
Technical amendments.

TITLE I—-TRANSFER OF NAVAL
VESSELS TO CERTAIN FOR-
EIGN RECIPIENTS

SEC. 101. TRANSFER OF NAVAL VESSELS TO CERTAIN FOR-

EIGN RECIPIENTS.

(a) TRANSFERS BY GRANT.—The President is au-

thorized to transfer vessels to foreign countries on a grant

basis under section 516 of the Foreign Assistance Act of

1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321j), as follows:

(1) MEx1ico.—To the Government of Mexico,

the OLIVER HAZARD PERRY class guided missile
fricates USS CURTS (FFG-38) and USS
MCCLUSKY (FFG-41).

(2) THAILAND.—To the Government of Thai-

land, the OLIVER HAZARD PERRY class guided
missile frigates USS RENTZ (FFG-46) and USS
VANDEGRIFT (FFG-48).

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O B NO I e

3

(b) TRANSFER BY SALE.—The President is author-
ized to transfer the OLIVER HAZARD PERRY class
cuided missile frigates USS TAYLOR (FFG-50), USS
GARY (FFG-51), USS CARR (FFG-52), and USS
ELROD (FFG-55) to the Taipei Economic and Cultural
Representative Office of the United States (which is the
Taiwan instrumentality designated pursuant to section
10(a) of the Taiwan Relations Act (22 U.S.C. 3309(a)))
on a sale basis under section 21 of the Arms Export Con-
trol Act (22 U.S.C. 2761).

(¢) ALTERNATIVE TRANSFER AUTHORITY.—Not-
withstanding the authority provided in subsections (a) and
(b) to transfer specific vessels to specific countries, the
President is authorized, subject to the same conditions
that would apply for such country under this Act, to trans-
fer any vessel named in this Act to any country named
in this Act such that the total number of vessels trans-
ferred to such country does not exceed the total number
of vessels authorized for transfer to such country by this
Act.

(d) GRANTS NOT COUNTED IN ANNUAL TOTAL OF
TRANSFERRED EXCESS DEFENSE ARTICLES.—The value
of a vessel transferred to another country on a grant basis
pursuant to authority provided by subsection (a) or (¢)

shall not be counted against the aggregate value of excess

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e D e T e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

4

defense articles transferred in any fiscal year under sec-
tion 516 of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C.
2321j).

(e) COSTS OF TRANSFERS.

Any expense incurred by
the United States in connection with a transfer authorized
by this section shall be charged to the recipient notwith-
standing section 516(e) of the Foreign Assistance Act of
1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321j(e)).

(f) REPAIR AND REFURBISHMENT IN UNITED

STATES SHIPYARDS.—To the maximum extent prac-
ticable, the President shall require, as a condition of the
transfer of a vessel under this section, that the recipient
to which the vessel is transferred have such repair or re-
furbishment of the vessel as is needed, before the vessel
joins the naval forces of that recipient, performed at a
shipyard located in the United States, including a United
States Navy shipyard.

() EXPIRATION OF AUTHORITY.—The authority to
transfer a vessel under this section shall expire at the end
of the 3-year period beginning on the date of the enact-

ment of this Act.

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 9 N U B WD =

|\ N \© R \O R O N N0 R e e e e T e T e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N R WD = O

-

J

TITLE II—ARMS EXPORT

CONTROL ACT AMENDMENT'S

SEC. 201. INCREASE IN CONGRESSIONAL NOTIFICATION

THRESHOLDS.

(a) FOREIGN MILITARY SALES.
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 36(b)(1) of the
Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776(b)(1)) is
amended—
(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph
(A)—

(1) by striking “$50,000,000” and in-
serting “$100,000,0007’;

(i1) by striking “$200,000,000” and
inserting “$300,000,000”’; and

(iii)) by striking “$14,000,000” and
inserting “$25,000,000”; and
(B) in the matter following subparagraph

(P)—

(1) by inserting ‘“‘of any defense arti-
cles or defense services under this Act for
$200,000,000 or more, any design and
construction services for $300,000,000 or
more, or any major defense equipment for

$75,000,000 or more,” after “The letter of

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

e T e S e e S e S
o N O W»n kA W NN = O

19

6

offer shall not be issued, with respect to a
proposed sale”’; and

(ii) by inserting “of any defense arti-

cles or services under this Act for

$100,000,000 or more, any design and

construction services for $200,000,000 or

more, or any major defense equipment for

$50,000,000 or more,” after “or with re-
spect to a proposed sale”.

(2) TECHNICAL AND CONFORMING AMEND-

MENTS.

Act (22 U.S.C. 2776(b)) 1s amended—

Section 36(b) of the Arms Export Control

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“‘Subject
to paragraph (6), in” and inserting “In’’;

(B) in paragraph (5)(C), by striking ““Sub-
ject to paragraph (6), if” and inserting “If”’;
and

(C) by striking paragraph (6).

(b) COMMERCIAL SALES.—Section 36(c) of the Arms

20 Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776(¢)) is amended—

21
22
23
24
25

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking “Subject to paragraph (5),
in”" and inserting “In”’;

(B) by striking “$14,000,000” and insert-
ing “$25,000,000”’; and

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

7

(C) by striking “$50,000,000” and insert-
ing “$100,000,0007;
(2) in paragraph (2)—

(A) in subparagraph (A), by inserting after
“for an export” the following: “‘of any major
defense equipment sold under a contract in the
amount of $75,000,000 or more or of defense
articles or defense services sold under a con-
tract in the amount of $200,000,000 or more,
(or, in the case of a defense article that is a
firearm controlled under category I of the
United States Munitions List, $1,000,000 or
more)”’; and

(B) in subparagraph (C), by inserting after
“license” the following: “for an export of any
major defense equipment sold under a contract
in the amount of $50,000,000 or more or of de-
fense articles or defense services sold under a
contract in the amount of $100,000,000 or
more, (or, in the case of a defense article that
1s a firearm controlled under category I of the
United States Munitions List, $1,000,000 or
more)’’;

(3) by striking paragraph (5); and

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

8
(4) by redesignating paragraph (6) as para-

oraph (5).

SEC. 202. LICENSING OF CERTAIN COMMERCE-CON-
TROLLED ITEMS.

Section 38 of the Arms Export Control Act (22
U.S.C. 2778) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing new subsection:

“(k) LICENSING OF CERTAIN COMMERCE-CON-

TROLLED [TEMS.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A license or other approval
from the Department of State granted in accordance
with this section may also authorize the export of
items subject to the Export Administration Regula-
tions if such items are to be used in or with defense
articles controlled on the United States Munitions
Last.

“(2) OTHER REQUIREMENTS.—The following

requirements shall apply with respect to a license or

other approval to authorize the export of items sub-

ject to the Export Administration Regulations under
paragraph (1):

“(A) Separate approval from the Depart-

ment of Commerce shall not be required for

such items if such items are approved for ex-

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I N© TR NG T NS I NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = ©

9

port under a Department of State license or
other approval.

“(B) Such items subject to the Export Ad-
ministration Regulations that are exported pur-
suant to a Department of State license or other
approval would remain under the jurisdiction of
the Department of Commerce with respect to
any subsequent transactions.

“(C) The inclusion of the term ‘subject to
the EAR’ or any similar term on a Department
of State license or approval shall not affect the
jurisdiction with respect to such items.

“(3) DEFINITION.—In this subsection, the term
)

‘Export Administration Regulations” means—

“(A) the Export Administration Regula-
tions as maintained and amended under the au-
thority of the International Emergency Eco-
nomic Powers Act (50 U.S.C. 1701 et seq.); or

“(B) any successor regulations.”.

SEC. 203. AMENDMENTS RELATING TO REMOVAL OF ITEMS

FROM THE UNITED STATES MUNITIONS LIST.

(a) REQUIREMENTS FOR REMOVAL OF MAJOR DE-
FENSE EQUIPMENT AND SIGNIFICANT MILITARY EQUIP-

MENT F'ROM THE UNITED STATES MUNITIONS LIST.—

*HR 3470 IH



10

1 Section 38(f) of the Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C.

2 2778(f)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

3

O o0 9 N »n A~

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

“(5)(A) Except as provided in subparagraph
(B), the President shall take such actions as may be
necessary to ensure that any major defense equip-
ment or significant military equipment that is re-
moved from the United States Munitions list and
transferred to the Commerce Control List for pur-
poses of commercial export 1s not subsequently
modified so as to transform such equipment into a
defense article.

“(B) The President may authorize the trans-
formation of major defense equipment or significant
military equipment that is removed from the United
States Munitions List and transferred to the Com-
merce Control List for purposes of commercial ex-
port into a defense article if the President—

“(1) determines that such transformation is
appropriate and in the national interests of the
United States; and

“(i1) provides notice of such transformation
to the chairman of the Committee on Foreign
Affairs of the House of Representatives and the
chairman of the Committee on Foreign Rela-

tions of the Senate consistent with the notifica-

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N e = N e R - BN B o) W ) TR~ O T NO S e

11
tion requirements of section 36(b)(5)(A) of this
Act.
“(C) In this paragraph—
“(1) the term ‘Commerce Control IList’
means—
“(I) items transferred from the
United States Munitions List to the Com-
merce Control List and designated as ‘600
series’ items on the Commerce Control List
under the Export Administration Regula-
tions, as proposed by the Bureau of Indus-
try and Security of the Department of
Commerce on July 15, 2011 (76 Fed. Reg.
41958); or
“(IT) any successor regulations; and
“(11) the term ‘defense article’ means an
item designated by the President pursuant to
subsection (a)(1).”.

(b) NOTIFICATION AND REPORTING REQUIREMENTS
FOR MAJOR DEFENSE EQUIPMENT AND SIGNIFICANT
MiLiTARY EQUIPMENT REMOVED KFROM THE UNITED
STATES MUNITIONS LIsT.—Section 38(f) of the Arms Ex-
port Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2778(f)), as amended by this
section, 1s further amended by adding at the end the fol-

lowing:

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0 N N R, WD = O

24

12

“(6) The President shall ensure that any item
that is major defense equipment or significant mili-
tary equipment and 1s removed from the United
States Munitions List shall continue to be subject to
the notification and reporting requirements of the
following provisions of law:

“(A) Section 516(f) of the Foreign Assist-
ance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321j(f)).
“(B) Section 655 of the Foreign Assist-

ance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C. 2415).

“(C) Seetion 3(d)(3)(A) of this Act.
“(D) Section 25 of this Act.
“(E) Sections 36(b), (¢), and (d) of this

Act.”.

SEC. 204. AMENDMENT TO DEFINITION OF “SECURITY AS-
SISTANCE” UNDER THE FOREIGN ASSIST-
ANCE ACT OF 1961.
Section 502B(d) of the Foreign Assistance Act of
1961 (22 U.S.C. 2304(d)) 1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “and” at the
end;

(2) in paragraph (2)(C) to read as follows:

“(C) any license in effect with respect to

the export to or for the armed forces, police, in-

*HR 3470 IH



13

| telligence, or other internal security forces of a
2 foreign country of—

3 “(1) defense articles or defense serv-
4 ices under section 38 of the Armed Export
5 Control Act; or

6 “(11) ‘600 series’ items on the Com-
7 merce Control List under the Export Ad-
8 ministration Regulations, as proposed by
9 the Bureau of Industry and Security of the
10 Department of Commerce on July 15,
11 2011 (76 Fed. Reg. 41958), or any suc-
12 cessor regulations;”’; and

13 (3) by adding at the end the following new
14 paragraphs:

15 “(3) the term ‘Commerce Control List’
16 means—

17 “(A) 1tems transferred from the United
18 States Munitions List to the Commerce Control
19 List and designated as ‘600 series’ items on the
20 Commerce Control List under the Export Ad-
21 ministration Regulations, as proposed by the
22 Bureau of Industry and Security of the Depart-
23 ment of Commerce on July 15, 2011 (76 Fed.
24 Reg. 41958); or
25 “(B) any successor regulations; and

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

14

“(4) the term ‘Export Administration Regula-
tions’ means—

“(A) the Export Administration Regula-
tions as maintained and amended under the au-
thority of the International Emergency Eco-
nomic Powers Act (50 U.S.C. 1701 et seq.); or

“(B) any successor regulations.”.

SEC. 205. AMENDMENTS TO DEFINITIONS OF “DEFENSE AR-
TICLE” AND “DEFENSE SERVICE” UNDER THE
ARMS EXPORT CONTROL ACT.
Section 47 of the Arms Export Control Act (22
U.S.C. 2794) is amended—

(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A)
of paragraph (3), by striking “includes” and insert-
ing “‘means, with respect to a sale or transfer by the
United States under the authority of this Act or any
other foreign assistance or sales program of the
United States”; and

(2) in paragraph (4), by striking “‘includes”
and inserting ‘“‘means, with respect to a sale or
transfer by the United States under the authority of
this Act or any other foreign assistance or sales pro-

oram of the United States,”.

*HR 3470 IH



15

1 SEC. 206. REVISION OF STATUTORY REFERENCES TO

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

FORMER NATO SUPPORT ORGANIZATIONS
AND RELATED NATO AGREEMENTS.

Section 21(e)(3) of the Arms Export Control Act (22

U.S.C. 2761(e)(3)) 1s amended—

(1) in subparagraphs (A) and (C)(i), by striking
“Maintenance and Supply Agency of the North At-
lantic Treaty Organization” and inserting ‘“‘North
Atlantic Treaty Organization (NATO) Support Or-
eanization and its executive agencies’’; and

(2) in subparagraph (C)(i)(II), by striking “a

[4

specific weapon system’” and inserting “activities’.

SEC. 207. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS.

The Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2751 et

seq.) 1s amended—

(1) n sections 3(a), 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 3(e),
5(e), 6, 21(g), 36(a), 36(0)(1), 36(b)(5)(C),
36(c)(1), 36(f), 38(MH)(1), 40(H)(1), 40(g
101(h), and 102(a)(2), by striking “the Speaker of

~—
—~~
(A
~—
—~~
~—
-

the House of Representatives and” each place it ap-
pears and inserting ‘“‘the Speaker of the IHouse of
Representatives, the Committee on Foreien Affairs
of the House of Representatives, and’’;

(2) i section 21(1)(1) by inserting after ‘‘the

Speaker of the House of Representatives” the fol-

*HR 3470 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

e S N T T Y =N =
N O L B~ WY = O

16

“, the Committees on Foreign Affairs and

lowing
Armed Services of the House of Representatives,”;

(3) in sections 25(e), 38(f)(2), 38()(3), and
38()(4)(B), by striking “International Relations”
each place it appears and inserting “‘Foreign Af-
fairs’’;

(4) in sections 27(f) and 62(a), by inserting
after ‘“‘the Speaker of the House of Representa-
tives,” each place it appears the following: ‘“‘the
Committee on Foreign Affairs of the House of Rep-
resentatives,”’; and

(5) in section 73(e)(2), by striking ‘“‘the Com-
mittee on National Security and the Committee on
International Relations of the House of Representa-
tives” and inserting ‘‘the Committee on Armed Serv-

ices and the Committee on Foreign Affairs of the

House of Representatives”.

O

*HR 3470 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-11-16T00:44:52-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




